
 MONDAY-10/14 TUESDAY-10/15 WEDNESDAY-10/16 THURSDAY-10/17 FRIDAY-10/18 

P
e

rso
n

al M
o

n
ey M

n
gt P

d
 1

 
    
 
 
 
 

NO SCHOOL 
TEACHERS IN 

SERVICE 

Assignment due: 
Lesson 10- Make it 
Happen: Saving for a 
Rainy Day. 
Worksheet 
Today’s Lesson: 
Exercise skills needed 
for saving and investing. 
Examine how saving and 
investing is part of 
financial well-being? 
Questions: What is a 
budget? 
What financial goals do 
you as students have? 

 

Assignment due: 
Lesson 10- Make it 
Happen: Saving for a 
Rainy Day. 
Worksheet 
Today’s Lesson: 
Exercise skills needed 
for saving and investing. 
Examine how saving and 
investing is part of 
financial well-being? 
Questions: What is a 
budget? 
What financial goals do 
you as students have? 

 

Assignment due: 
Lesson 11 Savvy 
Spending: Sharpening 
Money Decisions. 
Today’s Lesson: 
Assess personal 
spending behavior. 
Understand the concept 
of opportunity cost.  
Questions: What is a 
want? 
What is a need?  

Assignment due: 
Lesson 11 Savvy 
Spending: Sharpening 
Money Decisions 
Worksheet.  
Today’s Lesson: 
Evaluate spending 
choices when it comes 
to personal wants 
versus needs. 
Questions:  What is 
opportunity cost? 
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NO SCHOOL 
TEACHERS IN 

SERVICE 

Assignment due: 
Lesson 10- Make it 
Happen: Saving for a 
Rainy Day. 
Worksheet 
Today’s Lesson: 
Exercise skills needed 
for saving and investing. 
Examine how saving and 
investing is part of 
financial well-being? 
Questions: What is a 
budget? 
What financial goals do 
you as students have? 

 

Assignment due: 
Lesson 10- Make it 
Happen: Saving for a 
Rainy Day. 
Worksheet 
Today’s Lesson: 
Exercise skills needed 
for saving and investing. 
Examine how saving and 
investing is part of 
financial well-being? 
Questions: What is a 
budget? 
What financial goals do 
you as students have? 

 

Assignment due: 
Lesson 11 Savvy 
Spending: Sharpening 
Money Decisions. 
Today’s Lesson: 
Assess personal 
spending behavior. 
Understand the concept 
of opportunity cost.  
Questions: What is a 
want? 
What is a need?  

Assignment due: 
Lesson 11 Savvy 
Spending: Sharpening 
Money Decisions 
Worksheet.  
Today’s Lesson: 
Evaluate spending 
choices when it comes 
to personal wants 
versus needs. 
Questions:  What is 
opportunity cost? 
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NO SCHOOL 

Assignment due: 
Lesson 2 Publisher: 
Trifold Brochure. 
Today’s Lesson: 
Use a picture as a 
background. 
Insert and format a 
shape. 
Use stylistic sets. 

Assignment due: 
Lesson 2 Publisher: 
Trifold Brochure. 
Today’s Lesson: 
Arrange thumbnails. 
Edit captions and 
caption styles. 
Check the spelling of the 
entire publications. 

Assignment due: 
Do Apply 2-1 Picture 
Collage.  
Today’s Lesson: 
Arrange the pictures as 
instructed.  
Questions: 
How do you draw 
textbox in Publisher? 

Assignment due: 
Do Extend 2-1 Team 
Training. 
Today’s Lesson: 
Create the flyer 
following the 
instructions in the 
textbook. 
Questions: 



 

TEACHERS IN 
SERVICE 

Search for online 
pictures. 
Questions: 
How do you use a 
picture for a 
background? 
What are stylistic sets? 

Questions: 
How do you spell check 
the publication? 
How do you edit 
captions? 
 

How do you overlap 
pictures? 

 

How do you draw 
textbox in Publisher? 
How do you overlap 
pictures? 
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NO SCHOOL 
TEACHERS IN 

SERVICE 

Assignment due: 
Chapter 3 Review 
Today’s Lesson: 
Do Chapter 3 Review, 
Review Marketing 
Terms, Review 
Marketing Concepts.   
Questions:  What is a 
controller economy? 
What is 
macroeconomics? 

Assignment due: 
Review for Chapter 3 
Test. 
Today’s Lesson: 
Review for Chapter 3 
Test. 
Questions:  What are 
four types of economic 
utility? 
How do marketers use 
utility to increase 
customer satisfaction? 

Assignment due: 
Test on Chapter 3. 
Today’s Lesson: 
Test on Chapter 3.   
Questions:  What is a 
controller economy? 
What is 
macroeconomics? 

Assignment due: 
Test on Chapter 3. 
Today’s Lesson: 
Test on Chapter 3.   
Questions:  What is a 
controller economy? 
What is 
macroeconomics? 
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NO SCHOOL 
TEACHERS IN 

SERVICE 

Assignment due: 
Lesson 1 Publisher: 5k 
Walk/Run Flyer 
Today’s Lesson: 
Check spelling as you 
type. 
Format text and autofit. 
Use graphics. 
Insert a photo. 
Move, align and resize 
objects.  
Print flyer. 
Questions: How do you 
insert a picture in 
Publisher? 
How do you format 
text? 

Assignment due: 
Apply 1-1 Sale Flyer. 
Today’s Lesson: 
Make changes to the 
House for Sale flyer as 
instructed. 
Insert images as shown 
in the instructions. 
Questions: How do you 
use bestfit in Publisher? 
How do you delete text 
boxes not being used? 

Assignment due: 
Do Extend 1-1 
Decorative Rectangle. 
Today’s Lesson: 
Create the Register to 
Vote Flyer with the 
content on the Lessons 
drive.  
Questions: 
How do you draw 
textbox in Publisher? 
How do you overlap 
pictures? 
 

Assignment due: 
Expand 1-1 Spring Break 
Ad. 
Today’s Lesson: 
Following the 
instructions make the 
changes to the Spring 
Break Flyer. 
Questions: 
What is an attention 
grabber? 
Can you change a 
template in Publisher? 
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NO SCHOOL 
TEACHERS IN 

SERVICE 

Assignment due: 
Read Chapter 6. 
Fast Review Questions. 
Today’s Lesson: 
Chapter 6 Business 
Ownership and 
Operations. 
Know different types of 
business ownership. 
Identify types of 
businesses.  
Questions: What are 
the three types of 
business ownership? 
What different types of 
businesses? 

Assignment due: 
Chapter 6 Review. 
Today’s Lesson: 
Chapter 6 Review – 
Using Business Key 
Words and Review What 
you Learned. 
Questions: What is an 
advantage of a sole 
proprietor? 
What is a disadvantage 
of a sole proprietor? 
 

Assignment due: 
Workbook Pages 35-39 
and 41. 
Today’s Lesson: 
Do Key Words, Key 
Concepts, Analytical 
Skills 1 and 2, Reading 
Skills, and Writing Skills 
2. 
Questions: What is a 
certificate of limited 
partnership? 
What is included in this 
document? 
 

Assignment due: 
Chapter 6 Test. 
Today’s Lesson: 
Test on Chapter 6. 
Questions:  What are 
advantages of a sole 
proprietorship? 
What are some 
disadvantages of a sole 
proprietorship? 
 


