
** Lesson plans may deviate from day to day, as they are listed, due to pertinent conversation that may arise and/or 

additional attention that may be afforded to certain subjects.  ** 

 MONDAY-5/20 TUESDAY-5/21 WEDNESDAY-5/22 THURSDAY-5/23 FRIDAY-5/24 
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Assignments Due: Assignments Due: Assignments Due: Assignments Due: Assignments Due: 

          

 
 
Today's Lesson: Today's Lesson: 

 
 

 
Today's Lesson: Today's Lesson: Today's Lesson: 

 

   
 
  

Essential Questions: 
What character traits 
did Louie and the rest 
of the crew exhibit in 
order to get their 
plane back on the 
ground safely during 
the opening scenes? 
 
What character traits 
did Louie exhibit as a 
young boy that 
seemed to contradict 
his parental 
upbringing? 
 
Understand the 
events that led Louie 
Zamperini from being 
a troubled youth 
bound for the 
penitentiary to 
becoming one of our 
nation’s finest 
heroes: 

• Word Wall, 
etc. 

• Begin 
analysis of 
the film 
Unbroken 

• Complete 
accompanyi
ng question 
sheet 

 
 
 
Homework: 

Essential Questions: 
Which situation do 
you believe to more 
perilous: extremely 
limited rations or 
your raft being 
circled by sharks? 
 
Understand the 
events that led Louie 
Zamperini from being 
a troubled youth 
bound for the 
penitentiary to 
becoming one of our 
nation’s finest 
heroes: 

• Continue 
analysis of 
the film 
Unbroken 

• Complete 
accompanyi
ng question 
sheet 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Homework: 

Essential Questions: 
How would you have 
handled Mac’s 
apparent mental 
weakness? 
 
Understand the 
events that led Louie 
Zamperini from being 
a troubled youth 
bound for the 
penitentiary to 
becoming one of our 
nation’s finest 
heroes: 

• Continue 
analysis of 
the film 
Unbroken 

• Complete 
accompanyi
ng question 
sheet 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Homework: 

Essential Questions: 
Why didn’t Louie 
continue with the 
radio broadcast in 
Tokyo when given 
the opportunity? 
 
Understand the 
events that led Louie 
Zamperini from being 
a troubled youth 
bound for the 
penitentiary to 
becoming one of our 
nation’s finest 
heroes: 

• Continue 
analysis of 
the film 
Unbroken 

• Complete 
accompanyi
ng question 
sheet 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Homework: 

Essential Questions: 
Would you want to 
confront The Bird 
again after the war’s 
conclusion?  
 
If so, what do you 
do/say? 
 
Understand the 
events that led Louie 
Zamperini from being 
a troubled youth 
bound for the 
penitentiary to 
becoming one of our 
nation’s finest 
heroes: 

• Conclude 
analysis of 
the film 
Unbroken 

• Complete 
accompanyi
ng question 
sheet 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Homework: 
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Assignments Due: Assignments Due: Assignments Due: Assignments Due: Assignments Due: 

  
 

  
  
 
 

    

 
 
Today's Lesson: Today’s Lesson: 

 
 
 
Today's Lesson: Today's Lesson: Today's Lesson: 

  

     

 
 
 
Essential Questions: 
What city was 
Captain Shaw from? 
 
Why does Trip seem 
to have more of a 
chip on his shoulder 
than the rest of the 
54th? 
 
Understand the 
events that led to 
Robert Gould Shaw 
leading the U.S. Civil 
War’s first all-black 
volunteer company, 
fighting prejudices 
from both his own 
Union Army, and the 
Confederates: 

• Word Wall, 
etc. 

• Begin 
analysis of 
the film 
Glory 

• Complete 
accompanyi
ng question 
sheet 

 
 
 
 
 
Homework: 

Essential Questions: 
Why was Forbes 
verbally reprimanded 
for talking to his 
friend Thomas? 
 
Understand the 
events that led to 
Robert Gould Shaw 
leading the U.S. Civil 
War’s first all-black 
volunteer company, 
fighting prejudices 
from both his own 
Union Army, and the 
Confederates: 

• Continue 
analysis of 
the film 
Glory 

• Complete 
accompanyi
ng question 
sheet 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Homework: 

Essential Questions: 
Why was Shaw so 
blatantly critical of 
Forbes’s training of 
the men, especially 
when Jupiter was 
shooting with such 
success? 
 
Understand the 
events that led to 
Robert Gould Shaw 
leading the U.S. Civil 
War’s first all-black 
volunteer company, 
fighting prejudices 
from both his own 
Union Army, and the 
Confederates: 

• Continue 
analysis of 
the film 
Glory 

• Complete 
accompanyi
ng question 
sheet 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Homework: 

Essential Questions: 
Why does Colonel 
Shaw give in and 
allow his men to be 
used to torch the 
southern town after 
it was defeated? 
 
Understand the 
events that led to 
Robert Gould Shaw 
leading the U.S. Civil 
War’s first all-black 
volunteer company, 
fighting prejudices 
from both his own 
Union Army, and the 
Confederates: 

• Continue 
analysis of 
the film 
Glory 

• Complete 
accompanyi
ng question 
sheet 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Homework: 

Essential Question: 
Why does the 
director choose to 
have Shaw and Trip 
buried together in 
that final scene? 
 
Understand the 
events that led to 
Robert Gould Shaw 
leading the U.S. Civil 
War’s first all-black 
volunteer company, 
fighting prejudices 
from both his own 
Union Army, and the 
Confederates: 

• Conclude 
analysis of 
the film 
Glory 

• Complete 
accompanyi
ng question 
sheet 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Homework: 
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Assignments Due: Assignments Due: Assignments Due: Assignments Due: Assignments Due: 

    
  
 
 

    

Today's Lesson: Today's Lesson: 

 
 
 
Today's Lesson: Today's Lesson: Today's Lesson: 

 

 
 
 
 
  

 
  

 

Essential Questions: 
What city was 
Captain Shaw from? 
 
Why does Trip seem 
to have more of a 
chip on his shoulder 
than the rest of the 
54th? 
 
Understand the 
events that led to 
Robert Gould Shaw 
leading the U.S. Civil 
War’s first all-black 
volunteer company, 
fighting prejudices 
from both his own 
Union Army, and the 
Confederates: 

• Word Wall, 
etc. 

• Begin 
analysis of 
the film 
Glory 

• Complete 
accompanyi
ng question 
sheet 

 
 
 
 
 
 
Homework: 

Essential Questions: 
Why was Forbes 
verbally reprimanded 
for talking to his 
friend Thomas? 
 
Understand the 
events that led to 
Robert Gould Shaw 
leading the U.S. Civil 
War’s first all-black 
volunteer company, 
fighting prejudices 
from both his own 
Union Army, and the 
Confederates: 

• Continue 
analysis of 
the film 
Glory 

• Complete 
accompanyi
ng question 
sheet 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Homework: 

Essential Questions: 
Why was Shaw so 
blatantly critical of 
Forbes’s training of 
the men, especially 
when Jupiter was 
shooting with such 
success? 
 
Understand the 
events that led to 
Robert Gould Shaw 
leading the U.S. Civil 
War’s first all-black 
volunteer company, 
fighting prejudices 
from both his own 
Union Army, and the 
Confederates: 

• Continue 
analysis of 
the film 
Glory 

• Complete 
accompanyi
ng question 
sheet 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Homework: 

Essential Questions: 
Why does Colonel 
Shaw give in and 
allow his men to be 
used to torch the 
southern town after 
it was defeated? 
 
Understand the 
events that led to 
Robert Gould Shaw 
leading the U.S. Civil 
War’s first all-black 
volunteer company, 
fighting prejudices 
from both his own 
Union Army, and the 
Confederates: 

• Continue 
analysis of 
the film 
Glory 

• Complete 
accompanyi
ng question 
sheet 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Homework: 

Essential Question: 
Why does the 
director choose to 
have Shaw and Trip 
buried together in 
that final scene? 
 
Understand the 
events that led to 
Robert Gould Shaw 
leading the U.S. Civil 
War’s first all-black 
volunteer company, 
fighting prejudices 
from both his own 
Union Army, and the 
Confederates: 

• Conclude 
analysis of 
the film 
Glory 

• Complete 
accompanyi
ng question 
sheet 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Homework: 
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Assignments Due: Assignments Due: Assignments Due: Assignments Due: Assignments Due: 

  
 

        

 
 
Today's Lesson: Today’s Lesson: 

 
 
Today's Lesson: Today's Lesson: Today's Lesson: 

  

     

 
Essential Questions: 
What character traits 
did Louie and the rest 
of the crew exhibit in 
order to get their 
plane back on the 
ground safely during 
the opening scenes? 
 
What character traits 
did Louie exhibit as a 
young boy that 
seemed to contradict 
his parental 
upbringing? 
 
Understand the 
events that led Louie 
Zamperini from being 
a troubled youth 
bound for the 
penitentiary to 
becoming one of our 
nation’s finest 
heroes: 

• Word Wall, 
etc. 

• Begin 
analysis of 
the film 
Unbroken 

• Complete 
accompanyi
ng question 
sheet 

 
 
 
 
Homework: 

Essential Questions: 
Which situation do 
you believe to more 
perilous: extremely 
limited rations or 
your raft being 
circled by sharks? 
 
Understand the 
events that led Louie 
Zamperini from being 
a troubled youth 
bound for the 
penitentiary to 
becoming one of our 
nation’s finest 
heroes: 

• Continue 
analysis of 
the film 
Unbroken 

• Complete 
accompanyi
ng question 
sheet 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Homework: 

Essential Questions: 
How would you have 
handled Mac’s 
apparent mental 
weakness? 
 
Understand the 
events that led Louie 
Zamperini from being 
a troubled youth 
bound for the 
penitentiary to 
becoming one of our 
nation’s finest 
heroes: 

• Continue 
analysis of 
the film 
Unbroken 

• Complete 
accompanyi
ng question 
sheet 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Homework: 

Essential Questions: 
Why didn’t Louie 
continue with the 
radio broadcast in 
Tokyo when given 
the opportunity? 
 
Understand the 
events that led Louie 
Zamperini from being 
a troubled youth 
bound for the 
penitentiary to 
becoming one of our 
nation’s finest 
heroes: 

• Continue 
analysis of 
the film 
Unbroken 

• Complete 
accompanyi
ng question 
sheet 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Homework: 

Essential Questions: 
Would you want to 
confront The Bird 
again after the war’s 
conclusion?  
 
If so, what do you 
do/say? 
 
Understand the 
events that led Louie 
Zamperini from being 
a troubled youth 
bound for the 
penitentiary to 
becoming one of our 
nation’s finest 
heroes: 

• Conclude 
analysis of 
the film 
Unbroken 

• Complete 
accompanyi
ng question 
sheet 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Homework: 

  

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
    



 

     

     

     

 

     

     

     

 

     

     

     

 

     

     

     

 


